

Upton & Hatfield, LLP

10 Centre Street
P. O. Box 1090
Concord, NH 03302-1090
T 603-224-7791
F 603-224-0320

Offices also in:
Hillsborough
Jaffrey
Peterborough
Portsmouth

Town of Henniker
18 Depot Hill Road
Henniker, New Hampshire 03242

Statement #: 140906
August 31, 2019
File #: 190654-1

RE: v. Andre Cote, Jr. - Violation of Town Right-of-Way

CURRENT OUTSTANDING BALANCE:

\$0.00

08-05-19	NCM	Telephone call and exchange e-mail with Interim Town Administrator Russ Roy;	0.40
08-08-19	NCM	Receive and review Defendant's appearance; receive and review Defendant's Motion to Dismiss; outline objection; exchange multiple e-mails with Town officials regarding the same;	1.80
08-09-19	NCM	Outline factual and legal assertions in Defendant's motion to dismiss; outline and prepare objection to motion to dismiss;	7.30
08-12-19	NCM	Work on objection to motion to dismiss; office conference with Attorney Mayer;	4.80
08-14-19	BLM	Review and revise Objection to Motion to Dismiss; Office conf w/ Attorney Midolo	0.90
08-14-19	NCM	Office conference with Attorney Mayer; edit and finalize objection; exchange e-mail with Town regarding objection;	1.10
08-15-19	NCM	Finalize objection; exchange e-mail with Town regarding objection; receive and review Defendant's notice of intent to reply;	0.80
08-27-19	BLM	Review Rebuttal to Town's Objection to Motion to Dismiss; Office conf w/ Attorney Midolo	0.60
08-27-19	NCM	Office conference with Attorney Mayer; receive and review Defendant's Reply; outline possible surreply and request for findings; exchange e-mail with Town; prepare and work on surreply/findings, and motion for surreply;	3.90
08-28-19	BLM	Review Motion to File Surreply and Surreply	0.20
08-28-19	NCM	Work on motion of surreply and surreply; receive and review hearing notice; office conference with Attorney Mayer; work on findings;	2.50

TOTAL HOURS:

24.30

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES:

\$4,563.50

Upton & Hatfield, LLP

10 Centre Street
P. O. Box 1090
Concord, NH 03302-1090
T 603-224-7791
F 603-224-0320

Offices also in:
Hillsborough
Jaffrey
Peterborough
Portsmouth

Town of Henniker
18 Depot Hill Road
Henniker, New Hampshire 03242

Statement #: 140440
July 31, 2019
File #: 190654-1

RE: v. Andre Cote, Jr. - Violation of Town Right-of-Way

CURRENT OUTSTANDING BALANCE: \$0.00

07-15-19	NCM Receive and review return of service; receive and -review service e-filing; exchange e-mail with Town regarding the same;	0.40
----------	---	------

TOTAL HOURS: 0.40

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: \$74.00

DISBURSEMENTS:

07-09-19	Merrimack County Sheriff's Office Sheriff fees Andre Cote	62.00
----------	--	-------

Totals \$62.00

TOTAL STATEMENT: \$136.00

TOTAL - OUTSTANDING: \$136.00

Please remit to the Concord office.

Federal ID#: 02-0218790

PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT
THANK YOU

Upton & Hatfield, LLP

10 Centre Street
P. O. Box 1090
Concord, NH 03302-1090
T 603-224-7791
F 603-224-0320

Offices also in:
Hillsborough
Jaffrey
Peterborough
Portsmouth

Town of Henniker
18 Depot Hill Road
Henniker, New Hampshire 03242

Statement #: 140101
June 30, 2019
File #: 190654-1

RE: v. Andre Cote, Jr. - Violation of Town Right-of-Way

CURRENT OUTSTANDING BALANCE:

06-19-19	BLM	Review and revise Complaint	0.40	\$0.00
06-25-19	NCM	Review, edit, and finalize complaint; exchange e-mail with Town regarding same; e-file petition and receive and review notice of filing;	2.10	
06-27-19	NCM	Receive and review summons from court; prepare update to Town regarding summons and next steps;	0.50	

TOTAL HOURS:

3.00

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES:

\$571.00

DISBURSEMENTS:

06-25-19	NH E-File			
	Merrimack County Superior Court - Complaint	280.00		
	Filing Fee			
06-27-19	Expense Recovery			
	Postage	7.85		
	Totals			\$287.85

TOTAL STATEMENT:

\$858.85

TOTAL - OUTSTANDING:

\$858.85

Please remit to the Concord office.

Federal ID#: 02-0218790

PAYABLE UPON RECEIPT
THANK YOU

Upton & Hatfield, LLP

10 Centre Street
P. O. Box 1090
Concord, NH 03302-1090
T 603-224-7791
F 603-224-0320

Offices also in:
Hillsborough
Jaffrey
Peterborough
Portsmouth

Town of Henniker
18 Depot Hill Road
Henniker, New Hampshire 03242

Statement #: 139484
May 31, 2019
File #: 061022-1

05-07-19 E

05-10-19 E

05-13-19 E

05-15-19 E

05-16-19 BLM Office conf w/ Attorney Midolo re: Cote/Davison Road

0.40

05-16-19 NCM Re Davidson Road; receive, review, and analyze file materials; outline issues for petition; conference with Attorney Mayer;

1.50

\$0.00

TOTAL HOURS:

9.70

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES:

\$2,124.00

DISBURSEMENTS:

05-10-19 Expense Recovery
Telephone call

1.00

Upton & Hatfield, LLP

10 Centre Street
P. O. Box 1090
Concord, NH 03302-1090
T 603-224-7791
F 603-224-0320

Offices also in:
Hillsborough
Jaffrey
Peterborough
Portsmouth

Town of Henniker
18 Depot Hill Road
Henniker, New Hampshire 03242

Statement #: 137450
January 31, 2019
File #: 061022-1

Re: General

Responsible Attorney

Date	Description	Amount
01-02-19		\$0.00
01-03-19		
01-07-19		
01-08-19		
01-09-19		
01-09-19	P	
01-10-19	I	
01-11-19	B	
01-14-19	BLM Review file; Draft ltr to A. Cote; E-mail to M. Henry; E-mail from and to M. Henry; [REDACTED]	0.90
01-16-19		
01-17-19		
01-23-19		
01-28-19		
01-29-19		
01-30-19		
01-31-19		
01-31-19		

Upton & Hatfield, LLP

10 Centre Street
P. O. Box 1090
Concord, NH 03302-1090
T 603-224-7791
F 603-224-0320

Offices also in:
Hillsborough
Jaffrey
Peterborough
Portsmouth

Town of Henniker
18 Depot Hill Road
Henniker, New Hampshire 03242

Statement #: 136978
December 31, 2018
File #: 061022-1

Re: General

Responsible Attorney: Barton L. Mayer

CURRENT OUTSTANDING BALANCE: \$0.00

12-06-18	BLM	E-mail from C. Palmissano re: 66 Davison Road	0.80
12-10-18	BLM	E-mail from and to C. Palmissano re: Community Park; Review documents re: Cote/66 Davison Road	1.10
12-11-18	BLM	Research law; Reviewing documents; Drafting ltr to Board of Selectmen re: Cote/66 Davison Road; E-mail from and to C. Palmissano re: Board of Selectmen minutes	4.10
12-17-18	BLM	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
12-19-18	BLM	Tel from and tel to Selectman Hooper re: RSA 91-A:3/disclosing subject matter; Davison Road	0.40
12-20-18	BLM	E-mails from and to Selectman Hooper re: RSA 91-A:3; Davison Road; E-mails from and to C. Palmisano; Review deed and RA statement; Registry research re: Davison Road	0.70
12-20-18	BLM	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
12-27-18	BLM	[REDACTED]	[REDACTED]
12-28-18	BLM	E-mail from and to C. Palmisano re: Davison Road status	0.20

TOTAL HOURS: 7.90

TOTAL PROFESSIONAL SERVICES: \$1,619.50

DISBURSEMENTS:

12-19-18	Expense Recovery	
	Telephone call	1.00
12-20-18	Expense Recovery	
	Copies - Merrimack County Registry On-Line	4.00